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The determination of the Tribunal was as follows:-
 
Preliminary Issue
 
The claimant’s employment was terminated on the 11th March 2009.  He lodged his claim with the
Employment Appeals Tribunal on the 16th  October  2009.   This  claim was  lodged  outside  of  the

six-month time limit from the date of termination of employment imposed by the Unfair Dismissals

Acts, 1977 to 2007.   On the claimant’s own evidence, there were no exceptional circumstances as

described by the said Acts to cause this delay.  The Tribunal, therefore, ruled that it  did not

havejurisdiction  to  hear  this  case  and  the  claim  under  the  Unfair  Dismissals  Acts,  1977  to

2007  is dismissed.

 
The Tribunal proceeded to hear the appeal under the Redundancy Payments Acts, 1967 to 2007.
 
The claimant commenced employment with the respondent on the 31st June 2003; he was dismissed
on the 11th  March  2009.   The  claimant  maintained  that  in  December  2008,  a  director  of  the

company informed all  of  the employees that  the factory would be closing in  April  2009 and



hat they  would  receive  statutory  redundancy.   While  the  respondent  stated  that  all  employees

were informed of the factory’s impending closure on the 8th January 2009, they said no date was
given.
 
Previously, the claimant had received verbal and written warnings in respect of his non-attendance
at work and also for failing to contact the respondent on these absent days.  On the 14th October
2008 the claimant received a final written warning.  In November 2008 the claimant arrived late for
work and in an unfit state to carry out his duties.  Another final written warning was issued.  On the
7th February 2009 the claimant failed to turn up for work; the respondent wrote to the claimant on
the 13th February 2009 in respect of this.  This letter states that the claimant was now aware that the
factory was being shut down and that the respondent would be paying statutory redundancy and as
a result of this, they would give him one final chance to improve his attendance and behaviour. 
Through this letter, the respondent encouraged the claimant to adhere to the attendance rules and to
improve his behaviour.
 
On Monday 9th March 2009 the claimant arrived two hours late for work and unfit for work, he was
dismissed from his employment on the 11th March 2009.  The claimant in his evidence stated that
he felt that the respondent had dismissed him in order to avoid paying him redundancy.  Also for
some of these warnings, the claimant stated that he had sick certificates to cover these dates.
 
The respondent confirmed that notification of the impending redundancies was given to the
Department in January 2009.  Individual names were not provided.  The first redundancy took place
in May 2009 and the remaining 21 employees were made redundant in October 2009.   The
respondent had given the claimant an extra final chance so he would receive his redundancy. 
However when the claimant did not turn up for work in February 2009 there was a lot of
resentment from the other staff.  They had no other alternative in relation to the March incident, but
to dismiss him.
 
Determination
 
The Tribunal carefully considered the evidence adduced and the documentation provided at the
hearing.  It is clear that the claimant was dismissed in March 2009 due to behavioural reasons;
therefore he disqualified himself from the redundancy process.  Accordingly the Tribunal dismisses
the appeal under the Redundancy Payments Act 1967 to 2007.
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